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    Abstract  
    Language is a means for the membership 
in humanity, people learn it to express 
themselves and their basic needs, they use it 
also to exchange material and moral 
relationships. It is an essential tool for 
expressing thoughts, feelings and 
experiences. Therefore, life is mainly based 
on the proper and precise use of language in 
different communicative situations. 
         Arabic language can be learnt only 
when its teacher owns all skills, the 
expression is the first position in the 
hierarchy of learning linguistic skills and 
abilities in classrooms, as he performs 
various complex mental processes during 
this course of expression, so he retrieves his 
vocabulary by going back  to his linguistic 
wealth to select from the words needed to 
perform his idea, producing a verbal or a 
written form that expresses his intended  
meaning or feeling. 
       Within this paper, we attempt to 
highlight the position of this activity as it is 
one of the linguistic communication arts, 
and a branch of language as well as the clear 
and correct expression is a main purpose 
teaching Arabic according to modern 
curriculum. 
Keywords: expression,  language,  learning,  
learner,  education 
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Didactics of the expression activity 
in the light of the modern 

curriculum 
(The foundations and principles) 
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